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Setting up WiFi

Step 1 - Tap the three dots on the top right 
corner to bring up the side menu.

Step 2 - 1: Tap on the Raven logo quickly 
and repeatedly until you see additional 
options.
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Step 3 - Tap on Disable Sticky App. 23min.
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Step 4 - Exit the menu by tapping the ‘X’ 
in the top right-hand corner. Swipe inward 
from the rightmost edge of the screen to 
access the Android toolbar.

Step 5 -  Tap the Home icon to minimize 
the Raven application.

Step 6 - Open the Settings application 
(indicated by a gear symbol).
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Step 7 - Select within the wifi section and 
connect to your WiFi SSID. If the wifi 
toggles off and on too quickly to input the 
password, tap the SEARCH button and 
input the password into the text box. 
Select the text with a long-press of the 
field, then paste it into the password field 
in the WiFi section.

Search WiFi section

Step 9 - Open the Raven application. Your 
device should now be connected to the 
wifi network.

Raven App

Step 8 - Swipe from the side to bring up 
the Android toolbar. Tap the Home icon to 
minimize Settings.

Home icon
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